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Ms. Lynn A.S. Araki-Regan W N .

Budget Director, County of Maui
200 South High Street
Wailuku, Hawaii 96793

Honorable Alan M. Arakawa
Mayor, County of Maui

200 South High Street
Wailuku, Hawaii 96793

For Transmittal to:
Honorable G. Riki Hokama
Chair, Budget and Finance Committee
Maui County Council
200 South High Street
Wailuku, Hawaii 96793
Dear Chair Hokama:
SUBJECT: REPLACEMENT VEHICLE - LLBD 976/#1552

The Department is requesting approval for replacement of the above vehicle due to a vehicle
accident on March 10, 2017.

The amount of $30,000 is being requested for the inclusion in the FY 2018 Budget request,
Liquor Fund 913012C/7040.

Enclosed are copies of the appraisal report stating structural total loss and email regarding
replacement responsibility.

Sifiger y,&\( .

GleNn*MUkai, Director
Department of Liquor Control

GMigert
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Georgette Tyau - Fw: COM Car#1552 Appraisal Report.pdf

From: Lee Yonamine <leeyone52@yahoo.com>

To: "Bill.Pacheco@co.maui.hi.us" <Bill.Pacheco@co.maui.hi.us>
Date: 3/20/2017 9:32 AM

Subject: Fw: COM Car#1552 Appraisal Report.pdf

Attachments: COM Car#1552 Appraisal Report.pdf

On Sunday, March 19, 2017 7:52 PM, Ann Shinyama <adsinc@hawaii.rr.com> wrote:

Good morning Lee
Please use this appraisal report attached when forwarding the file.

Thank you Ann

file:///C:/Users/county%20employee/AppData/Local/Temp/XPgrpwise/58D0027Cmis2dom... 4/6/2017



Date:  3/19/2017 07:44 PM
Supplement: 0

ADS Collision Appraisals Inc.

P.O. Box 194, Wailuku, Hi 96793
(808) 264-8987
Fax: (866) 508-6735
Email: adsinc@hawaii.rr.com

APPRAISALREPORT

DAMAGE ASSESSED BY: Ann Shinyama

FILE NUMBER: None ASSIGNMENT DATE: None
CLAIM NUMBER: CAR #1552 CONTACT DATE: None
DATE OF LOSS:  3/10/2017 INSPECTION DATE: None
TYPE OF LOSS: REC'D DATE: None

APPRAISED FOR:

(s) of Impact
‘ont Center (P)

INSURED: COUNTY OF MAUI CLAIMANT: None
OWNER: COUNTY OF MAUI BODY SHOP: None
INSPECTION SITE: None

JUALITY RECYCLED PARTS: No
{FTERMARKET NEW PARTS; Yes
VEHICLE DRIVEABLE: Unknown

Comments:

Vehcicle is a structural total loss. Mitchell estimate actual cash
value $12525.00

Damage found the front bumper cover, absorber, reinforcement, rt & lt
headlights, grille assy, hood panel, hood hinges and latch, rt & 1t
unibody rails,lt fender, 1t fender liner, radiator support, ac
condenser, radiator, radiator radiator up hose, fan assy, air cleaner
top & bottom cover, drivers air bag, front air bag sensor, clock
spring, rcm, steering column (srs components per mitchell necessary to

replace after drivers airbag deployment) driver seat belt, seat belt
buckle, seat belt adjuster with the necessary refinishing and

blending.

COMPARISON ESTIMATE: 0.00 TOWING: 0.00 ACTUAL CASH VALUE: 12,525.0
APPRAISER ESTIMATE: 16,775.32 STORAGE: 0.00 SALVAGE VALUE: 0.0
AGREED UPON AMOUNT: 0.00 DEDUCTIBLE: UNKNOWN SETTLEMENT: 0.0
REPAIR VS. ACV: 0.0
DRAFT/CHECK NUMBER: 0 ESTIMATE FEE: 0.0
DRAFT/CHECK AMOUNT: 0.00 TRAVEL EXPENSE: 0.0
DATE ISSUED: None PHOTO EXPENSE: 0.0
MISC EXPENSE: 0.0
TOTAL CHARGES: 0.0
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Georgette Tyau - Re: Replacement Vehicle-LBD 976/#1552

From: Lydia Toda

To: Georgette Tyau

Date: 4/6/2017 10:21 AM

Subject: Re: Replacement Vehicle-LBD 976/#1552
cc Bridget Nakama; Glenn Mukai

Georgette,
All costs relating to physical damage to any fleet vehicle, including repairs and replacement if the vehicle is
deemed a total loss, are borne by the respective department.

Lydia A. Toda | Risk Management Officer
Dept. of the Corporation Counsel | Risk Management Division
200 S. High Street, 3rd Floor | Wailuku, Maui, HI 96793

Office +1.808.270.7535
Direct +1.808.270.7897
Lydia.Toda@co.maui.hi.us

NOTICE: The information in this transmittal (including attachments, if any) is privileged and confidential and is intended only for the recipient(s) listed
above. Any review, use, disclosure, distribution or copying of this transmittal is prohibited except by, or on behalf of, the intended recipient. If you
have received this transmittal in error, please notify me immediately by reply email and destroy all copies of the transmittal.

>>> Georgette Tyau 4/6/2017 10:09 AM >>>
good morning,

Please clarify if County Insurance or Department is responsible for replacement of vehicle due to accident.

thank you.
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